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Welcome to Cuba's automotive time capsule, filled with classic cars.

The story of how Cuba came to be trapped in automotive time is a fascinating one. For decades, the island
country had enjoyed healthy tourism trade and American outpost status, and by the 1950s it had the highest
per capita automotive purchasing of any Latin American country - its middle class ensured an interesting
variety of vehicles plying the roads. But when Cuba fell to communist rebels in 1959, so ended the inflow of
new cars. Since then, trade embargo forced Cuba's car enthusiasts to develop a unique and insular culture,
one marked by great creativity, such as:

Keeping a car alive with no opportunity to acquire replacement parts

Customizing a car with no access to aftermarket parts

Drag racing with no drag strip

In many ways, Cuba is an automotive time warp, where the newest car is a 1959 Chevy or perhaps one of the
Soviet Ladas. Cuba's Car Culture offers an inside look at a unique car culture, populated with cars that have
been cut off from the world so long that they've morphed into something else in the spirit of automotive
survival.

Authors Tom Cotter and Bill Warner (founder of the Amelia Island Concours) take readers of Cuba's Car
Culture on a whirlwind tour of all things automotive, beginning with Cuba's pre-Castro car and racing
history and bringing us up to today's lost collector cars, street racing, and the challenges of keeping decades-
old cars on the road. The book is illustrated throughout with rare historical photos as well as contemporary
photos of Cuba's current car scene. For anyone who enjoys classic cars, from old Chevy Bel-Airs to
Studebakers to Ford Fairlanes, a cruise around Cuba will make you feel like a kid in a candy store.
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From reader reviews:

Jamie Arellano:

The book Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the Island's Automotive Love Affair gives you the sense of being
enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your best
friend when you getting pressure or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading through a
book Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the Island's Automotive Love Affair to get your habit, you can get
considerably more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects.
You are able to know everything if you like open and read a guide Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the
Island's Automotive Love Affair. Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science publication or
encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Jeanne Gonzales:

Do you one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
this aren't like that. This Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the Island's Automotive Love Affair book is
readable through you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the information here are arrange for
enjoyable examining experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to supply to you.
The writer associated with Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the Island's Automotive Love Affair content
conveys prospect easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in the
content but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the Island's
Automotive Love Affair is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Nicholas Valles:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the character types do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you
read this Cuba's Car Culture: Celebrating the Island's Automotive Love Affair, you are able to tells your
family, friends and also soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a
publication.

Clark Abeyta:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to go through a book. When you
study a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
since book has a lot of information in it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you



want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these us novel, comics, and soon. The Cuba's Car
Culture: Celebrating the Island's Automotive Love Affair will give you a new experience in looking at a
book.
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