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The “business benefits” you can get from exercise are legion, which is

why your company provides a gym or a gym membership. But sending

you there is the worst thing your company can do to you.

Your company means to help. Your HR department and the big cheeses

in the C-suite want to do something good for you, but sending you to do the

corporate workout (The Workout) is not good for them, you, or your company.

The truth is that many successful Americans get physical activity, but

they don’t get the right kind of physical activity. One in four Americans

does absolutely no exercise. Yet, “exercise is the single best thing” a



professional like you can do for mood and memory, according to Business

Insider. A lot of businesses are furnishing stand-up desks for you, which

is fine until you head off to the gym, sit down, and toss all the benefits out

the window.

Wait a minute! Shouldn’t you get to the gym and break a sweat?

No! Never!

 

So how is success killing you?

 

Whether you work at some big, faceless, multinational corporation or

you’ve built up your own business, the perk of a gym in the building or



a membership somewhere offers only The Workout. The Workout takes

place in a room filled with free weights, weight machines, and TVs to

take your mind off the drudgery of whatever exercise you’re performing.

There’s also spinning, treadmills, benches, inclining sit-up boards, and

mirrors. Lots of mirrors. Got to have those mirrors to admire yourself.

The Workout takes an hour to complete, usually more, and that’s Problem

#1. Be honest with yourself: do you really have this kind of time to spend

on a workout? With your schedule? With your deadlines? With all that’s

expected of you? At work? At home?

While trudging your way through The Workout you move from station to

station, convinced that you’re working all your important muscle groups.



Arms here, legs there—and don’t forget the abs. It’s always swimsuit

season somewhere.

But what have you really done? You’ve sat. That’s right, you’ve been

sitting the whole time. You’ve sat to do curls with free weights, you’ve sat

to do leg presses, you’ve sat to do lat pulls, you’ve sat during spin class—

you’ve been on your butt during the entire workout!

Then, to top it off, you’ve been on your back and sat up 25 times

performing “crunches,” as sit-ups are known to members of that secret

society that makes up Corporate Workout World.

You might be saying that The Workout is better than nothing. But no,

you’re wrong. Only walking is better than nothing.



All that sitting, as you know by now, is killing you. And your workout is

making it worse.

Is it any wonder why your back is achy, your muscles are sore, and your

joints are creaky? You’re supposed to be curing yourself of all the sitting

you do at work, and you wind up doing more sitting. The irony is too

thick.

Your body is getting old, and it’s getting old quickly.
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From reader reviews:

Micheal Moore:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you
is you don't know which you should start with. This Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that reverse the
effects of corporate life is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book
serves what you want and want in this era.

Bella Singer:

This Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that reverse the effects of corporate life tend to be reliable for you
who want to be a successful person, why. The reason why of this Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that
reverse the effects of corporate life can be one of many great books you must have will be giving you more
than just simple reading through food but feed you actually with information that perhaps will shock your
before knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that
reverse the effects of corporate life giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary, giving
you tryout of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and revel in
reading.

Brooke Callender:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get great deal of
stress from both daily life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely without
a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are you experiencing
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer may unlimited right. Then do you try this one,
reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the actual book you have read is
usually Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that reverse the effects of corporate life.

Bruno Reed:

Beside this particular Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that reverse the effects of corporate life in your
phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the
knowledge you may got here is fresh from oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an previous
people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have Is Your Job Killing You?: Workouts that reverse the
effects of corporate life because this book offers for you readable information. Do you occasionally have
book but you rarely get what it's about. Oh come on, that would not happen if you have this inside your hand.
The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to
miss that? Find this book as well as read it from today!
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