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At the end of the Qing dynasty, works of fiction by male authors placed women in new roles. Fiction’s
Family delves into the writings of one literary family from western Zhejiang whose works were emblematic
of shifting attitudes toward women. The mother, Wang Qingdi, and the father, Zhan Sizeng, published their
poems during the second half of the nineteenth century. Two of their four sons, Zhan Xi and Zhan Kai, wrote
novels that promoted reforms in women’s lives. This book explores the intergenerational link, as well as
relations between the sons, to find out how the conflicts faced by the parents may have been refigured in the
novels of their sons. Its central question is about the brothers’ reformist attitudes. Were they based on the
pronouncements of political leaders? Were they the result of trends in Shanghai publishing? Or did they
derive from Wang Qingdi’s disappointment in her “companionate marriage,” as manifested in her poems?
By placing one family at the center of this study, Ellen Widmer illuminates the diachronic bridge between
the late Qing and the period just before it, the synchronic interplay of genres during the brothers’ lifetimes,
and the interaction of Shanghai publishing with regions outside Shanghai.
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From reader reviews:

Holly Silva:

The book Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi, Zhan Kai, and the Business of Women in Late-Qing China (Harvard-
Yenching Institute Monograph Series) can give more knowledge and also the precise product information
about everything you want. Why must we leave the best thing like a book Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi, Zhan
Kai, and the Business of Women in Late-Qing China (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series)? Some
of you have a different opinion about reserve. But one aim in which book can give many information for us.
It is absolutely appropriate. Right now, try to closer together with your book. Knowledge or info that you
take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi,
Zhan Kai, and the Business of Women in Late-Qing China (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series)
has simple shape however, you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can appearance the
enormous world by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Jose Reed:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era which is always change and move forward. Some
of you maybe may update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems
coming to a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi, Zhan
Kai, and the Business of Women in Late-Qing China (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in
this era.

Anne Hernandez:

Often the book Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi, Zhan Kai, and the Business of Women in Late-Qing China
(Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) has a lot info on it. So when you make sure to read this book
you can get a lot of help. The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research
prior to write this book. That book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after perusing this book.

Marcos Hawkins:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many issue for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book and also novel and Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi, Zhan Kai, and the Business of
Women in Late-Qing China (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series) as well as others sources were
given information for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel wish to read more and more.
Science reserve was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to
add their knowledge. In different case, beside science guide, any other book likes Fiction's Family: Zhan Xi,
Zhan Kai, and the Business of Women in Late-Qing China (Harvard-Yenching Institute Monograph Series)



to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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