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Jennie Lee was the brave, passionate, and beautiful miner's daughter from Scotland who became a socialist
MP at the age of 24, before she was old enough to vote. In spite of her youth, she was one of the finest
political orators of her day, as much at home in Scottish working-men's clubs as in the chamber at
Westminster. She married Aneurin Bevan on the rebound from a tragic love affair, and became his loyal
comrade through the lonely war years, the trials of founding the NHS, and the bitter internal feuds of the
1950s. Her mission was to make Nye the leader of the Labour party; she was the 'dark angel', 'Nye's Lady
Macbeth', both loved and loathed by fellow MPs. She broke down after Nye's early death in 1960 but was
rescued by Harold Wilson who made her the first Minister for the Arts. With his support she founded the
Open University. Jennie Lee is the biography of a stormy political dissenter; the study of a pioneering
woman MP whose socialism undermined her feminism; the moving and intimate story of an outstanding
political marriage; the chronicle of the first, and most successful, Minister for the Arts. What emerges is a
compelling portrait of a remarkable woman: widely admired, loved more often than she was liked, and
impossible to ignore.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Jones:

What do you consider book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that query above. Every person has
various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't need do
that. You must know how great as well as important the book Jennie Lee: A Life. All type of book would
you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Cynthia Briscoe:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information currently can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously
which one is suitable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable
resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Jennie Lee: A Life as the daily resource information.

Eugene Brown:

The book untitled Jennie Lee: A Life is the e-book that recommended to you to learn. You can see the
quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you. The language that article author use to explained
their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of investigation when
write the book, hence the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also can
get the e-book of Jennie Lee: A Life from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Travis Davis:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got pupils? We believe that that issue was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also know
that little person similar to reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know that reading is
very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to include you knowledge, except
your own teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous
books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is actually Jennie Lee: A Life.
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