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Herb Caen, a popular columnist for the San Francisco Chronicle, recently quoted a Voice of America press
release as saying that it was reorganizing in order to "eliminate duplication and redundancy. " This quote
both states a goal of data compression and illustrates its common need: the removal of duplication (or
redundancy) can provide a more efficient representation of data and the quoted phrase is itself a candidate for
such surgery. Not only can the number of words in the quote be reduced without losing informa tion, but the
statement would actually be enhanced by such compression since it will no longer exemplify the wrong that
the policy is supposed to correct. Here compression can streamline the phrase and minimize the em
barassment while improving the English style. Compression in general is intended to provide efficient
representations of data while preserving the essential information contained in the data. This book is devoted
to the theory and practice of signal compression, i. e. , data compression applied to signals such as speech,
audio, images, and video signals (excluding other data types such as financial data or general purpose
computer data). The emphasis is on the conversion of analog waveforms into efficient digital representations
and on the compression of digital information into the fewest possible bits. Both operations should yield the
highest possible reconstruction fidelity subject to constraints on the bit rate and implementation complexity.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Thibodeaux:

Inside other case, little individuals like to read book Vector Quantization and Signal Compression (The
Springer International Series in Engineering and Computer Science). You can choose the best book if you
want reading a book. So long as we know about how is important a book Vector Quantization and Signal
Compression (The Springer International Series in Engineering and Computer Science). You can add
understanding and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may be known.
About simple matter until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book or perhaps
searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the
library. Let's examine.

Leon Fisher:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to explain
what you problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you don't have spare
time to complete others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have free time?
What did you do? Every person has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question because
just their can do in which. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is correct.
Because start from on pre-school until university need this particular Vector Quantization and Signal
Compression (The Springer International Series in Engineering and Computer Science) to read.

Robert Hightower:

As a student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's soul or real their
passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there but
nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
pics on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on
this age, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Vector Quantization and Signal Compression (The Springer International Series in
Engineering and Computer Science) can make you experience more interested to read.

John Threadgill:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got learners? We believe that that question
was given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You
should know that reading is very important along with book as to be the matter. Book is important thing to
include you knowledge, except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update



concerning something by book. Many kinds of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them
is this Vector Quantization and Signal Compression (The Springer International Series in Engineering and
Computer Science).
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