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Prepare yourself for the heart-stopping romance of newcomer Liz Carlyle. My False Heart is the luminescent
love story of a chance meeting between two strangers one dark, rain-swept night in the English countryside.
From that moment on, their destinies are forever changed.
When Elliot Armstrong, the dissolute marquis of Rannoch, pursues a spiteful mistress into the wilds of Essex
to sever their relationship, he is surprised to find himself hopelessly lost -- in more ways than one.
Inexplicably drawn to a warmly fit house along an isolated country lane, he is mistaken for an overdue guest
-- but he dares not reveal his identity for fear of being tossed back out into the torrential rain, a fate he
admittedly deserves. The loving family that innocently welcomes Rannoch into their midst soon challenges
his cynical convictions, and ultimately, resurrects his shattered dreams.
The beautiful Evangeline van Artevalde is an artist of exceptional talent and extraordinary secrets. Isolated
from society by choice, the half-Flemish refugee has fled her homeland in search of a secure haven for the
children in her family. But even the Essex countryside, she finds, is not without danger. As the clutches of
her aristocratic English relatives tighten, Evangeline holds them at bay by sheer force of will, unleashing her
emotions only within the walls of her studio. The furthest thing from her heart is desire -- until a drenched,
strikingly handsome man shows up at her doorstep late one night. Soon, Evangeline finds she can no longer
confine her passions to oil paint and canvas.
Drawn by desire, Elliot and Evangeline discover a powerful love neither thought possible. But malevolent
forces surround them, and soon their secrets will be exposed and their hearts tested to unthinkable limits.
Only if they can forgive the past will they have a future....
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Pippin:

This My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron series Book 1) book is just not ordinary book, you
have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book will be information
inside this book incredible fresh, you will get information which is getting deeper you read a lot of
information you will get. This specific My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron series Book 1)
without we know teach the one who examining it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't end up
being worry My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron series Book 1) can bring if you are and not
make your tote space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even phone.
This My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron series Book 1) having great arrangement in word in
addition to layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Bonnie Boyd:

Typically the book My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron series Book 1) will bring that you the
new experience of reading a book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In the event you try
to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan
Cameron series Book 1) is much recommended to you to study. You can also get the e-book in the official
web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Milton Hill:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Try to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its deal with may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron
series Book 1) why because the wonderful cover that make you consider about the content will not
disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Cherie Fidler:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our know-how for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year seemed to
be exactly added. This reserve My False Heart (Lorimer Family & Clan Cameron series Book 1) was filled
regarding science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your scientific research competence.
Some people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you
can feel enjoy to read a publication. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.
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